
Together Till the End POISED AND READY. Most Valu-
able Player Caroline Carter, concen-
trates on pitching a strike. Caroline reo
turned to the team this year after miss-
ing two years because of knee prob-
lems.

OUTFIELD RULES! After catching a
pop fly in left field, Coleman Startsman
throws it to shortstop Frances Ladd.
Coleman's outfield abilities proved to
be a valuable asset to the Lady Eagles.

HITS AND RUNS! The Eagles hud-
dle together for some quick hitting in-
structions. These little talks proved to
be very successful as the Lady Eagles
averaged 12 hits per game.

94 Varsity Softball

GONE WITH THE WIND. Junior
Lindsey Bonds loses her helmet on her
way to score another run for the Ea-
gles. Lindsey's speed contributed
greatly to the team while on base or in
right center.

PRACTICE MAKES PERFECT.
Katherine Brown tosses tennis balls to
Kimberly Weed during a hitting prac-
tice before a home game against King.
Their hard work payed off as the Ea-
gles beat their conference rival 12 to 7.

SENIOR SUPERIORTY. Senior Car-
oline Wilkins is hugged by Jennifer At-
kerson and Kimberly Weed. During the
last game, Caroline, along with two
other seniors, was recognized and
given balloons and an autographed
ball.


