
DUTIES OF HOl\OR. Prior to the
Baccalaureate service, junior mar-
shals Frances Ladd, Maribeth Cole-
man, Courtney Melton, Kim Jones,
and ally Hinnant pose for a picture
at the church.

"THE MAJESTY AND GLORY".
Filled with mixed emotions of rever-
ence and excitement, the senior cho-
rus members join with the rest of the
chorus in singing "The Majesty and
Glory".

LINE 'EM UP! Ms.Heather Driggers,
class sponsor, gives final instructions
to the seniors before the processional
into the church. She did a super job
handling this spirited group.

THE CLASS OF '98 RULES! Minus a
tardy Tanner Pope, these energetic
grads gather for a final photo session
on the steps of the Bethel ARP
Church. Soon they will become RWA
alumni'

READY AND WAITING. Mike
Schaeffer makes a quick tassel adjust-
ment before heading down the aisle
in the Baccalaureate processional.
Mike and fellow seniors eagerly an-
ticipated this event for a long time.

Graduation


