
Back again. Fall is the time when we
return from the unrestrained
freedom that is summer to the
structure found in school. Through
this transition, we come to find out
that coming back to school does not
mark the end of the world. As we
walk through the halls, we find
familiar friends as well as new faces.
Despite the toil of homework and
assignments, we are filled with
anticipation, excitement of the year
to come ... Friday night football
games, Miss RWA,Homecoming
festivities, a Square Dance ... Yes,
Fall brings the imposing school year,
the stress and strain of tests,
essays, exams ... but with it comes
the opportunity to branch out, live it
up, and make memories that will last
us a lifetime. Just getting it done ...


